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42 They were continually devoting 
themselves to the apostles' 
teaching and to fellowship, to the 
breaking of bread and to prayer. 
 43 Everyone kept feeling a sense 
of awe; and many wonders and 
signs were taking place through 
the apostles. 
 44 And all those who had 
believed were together and had 
all things in common; 
 45 and they began selling their 
property and possessions and 
were sharing them with all, as 
anyone might have need. 
 46 Day by day continuing with 
one mind in the temple, and 
breaking bread from house to 
house, they were taking their 
meals together with gladness and 
sincerity of heart, 
 47 praising God and having favor 
with all the people. And the Lord 
was adding to their number day 
by day those who were being 
saved. 

32 And the congregation of those 
who believed were of one heart 
and soul; and not one of them 
claimed that anything belonging 
to him was his own, but all things 
were common property to them. 
 33 And with great power the 
apostles were giving testimony to 
the resurrection of the Lord 
Jesus, and abundant grace was 
upon them all. 
 34 For there was not a needy 
person among them, for all who 
were owners of land or houses 
would sell them and bring the 
proceeds of the sales 
 35 and lay them at the apostles' 
feet, and they would be 
distributed to each as any had 
need. 

12 At the hands of the apostles 
many signs and wonders were 
taking place among the people; 
and they were all with one accord 
in Solomon's portico. 
 13 But none of the rest dared to 
associate with them; however, 
the people held them in high 
esteem. 
 14 And all the more believers in 
the Lord, multitudes of men and 
women, were constantly added to 
their number, 
 15 to such an extent that they 
even carried the sick out into the 
streets and laid them on cots and 
pallets, so that when Peter came 
by at least his shadow might fall 
on any one of them. 
 16 Also the people from the cities 
in the vicinity of Jerusalem were 
coming together, bringing people 
who were sick or afflicted with 
unclean spirits, and they were all 
being healed. 

 


